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Remarkable 
Rebuke

The first pasuk in Sefer Devarim is very 
curious. It begins, “These are the words 
that Moshe spoke to all of Israel.” (Devarim 
1:1) But instead of his words, we find a 
detailed description of his location, listing 
all the places in the area, “…on the east 
bank of the Jordan, in the desert and in the 
Aravah, near Suf, in the vicinity of Paran, 
Tofel, Lavan, Chatzerot, and Di Zahav.” 
(Ibid.) What is the significance of recording 
this information? 

The Malbim explains that these were the 
various places at which Moshe Rabbeinu 
“spoke words” to the people. Rashi, how-
ever, teaches that the name of each place 
hints at a different sin that was committed 
in that location during the Jews’ sojourn in 
the desert. Unlike the Malbim, Rashi under-
stands these names as actually expressing 

the words of rebuke that Moshe Rabbeinu 
spoke, as opposed to describing the places 
in which he spoke them. Rashi continues to 
explain that to protect the honor of the Jew-
ish people, Moshe Rabbeinu spoke words 
that implied or suggested rebuke, rather 
than chastising the people directly.

This sensitivity that Moshe Rabbeinu dis-
played is the hallmark of a Jew. Each Jew is 
created in the image of G-d and has a spark 
of G-dliness in him. It is therefore most 
appropriate to treat each person with the 
dignity that he deserves. The mishnah in 
Avot teaches, “The dignity of your student 
should be as precious to you as your own; 
the dignity of your colleague, as your awe 
of your master; and your awe of your mas-
ter as your awe of Heaven.” (Avot 4:12). In 
Alei Shur, Rav Wolbe quotes his rebbe, Rav 
Yerucham, and asks, why are we exhorted 
to treat another one notch above our own 
level? His response is powerful. It is so 
hard to give others the honor they deserve, 
therefore, if one aims high, then there is 
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hope that the other person will receive his 
due honor. 

Parashat Devarim is always read on Shab-
bat Chazon. In our effort to combat the 
baseless hatred that consumes us, we must 
first and foremost integrate this quintes-
sential idea in our relationships. We all 
must heighten our awareness of how spe-
cial each person is and treat everyone with 
the dignity that they deserve. As we hone 
our sensitivity and realize how hard it is 
to honor each person, we can increase our 
efforts to accord others even greater honor 
and respectability. In this way, we can do 
our part to rectify the hatred and negativity 
that led to the churban.

The Slonimer Rebbe finds a second les-
son from Rashi’s understanding that the 
names of the places mentioned indicated 
specific mussar that Moshe wanted to 
share. “Reishit chochma yirat Hashem.” 
(Tehillim 111:10) Everything begins with 
awe of Hashem - the ability to humbly rec-
ognize Hashem’s Omnipresence. To receive 
the depth and breadth of Torah that Moshe 
was transmitting at this time, Am Yisrael 
needed to be prepared with feelings of 
humility and contrition. Similarly, the dif-
ficult galut experience engenders feelings 
of brokenness, the precursor to the future 
grand revelation of goodness. May all we 
have endured as a people coupled with 
deep sensitivity for each other, serve to 
bring the Ultimate Redemption speedily in 
our days. 
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more about patient self-control than phys-
ical might. It is found in the Talmudic trac-
tate Kiddushin 40a, where the tale is told 
about a certain Rabbi Zadok, who resists 
the attempts of a particularly powerful 
noblewoman to lead him astray. He exerts 
moral strength, and to him the Talmud ap-
plies the following biblical verse: "Bless the 
Lord, O His angels, mighty creatures who 
do His bidding, ever obedient to His bid-
ding. Bless the Lord, all His hosts, His ser-
vants who do His will." (Psalms 103:20-21)

Isaac's way recognizes the necessity for 
great patience and forbearance. If we 
adopt Isaac's way, we must be prepared 
for a lengthy process before our challeng-
es are resolved. In the words of Rabbi 
Abraham Isaac Kook, words which have 
been memorialized in a popular song, "An 
eternal people does not fear the long and 
arduous path."

Patience is necessary for those who fol-
low Isaac's way. But a wise woman taught 
us that patience is but another name for 
hope. That woman was Jane Austen, who 
put these words into the mouth of one of 
the characters in her great novel, Sense and 
Sensibility: "Know your own happiness. 
You want nothing but patience—or give it a 
more fascinating name: call it hope." 
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Rehavia-Talbieh on quiet Radak

May the Torah learned from this issue of TT 
be in loving memory and לע"נ our dear 
parents whose yahrtzeits are in Kislev

Doris Weinberger a"h
דבורה לאה בת יחזקאל שלמה ע"ה- ד' כסלו

Max Weinberger z”l
אלימלך בן דב ז"ל- כ"ז כסלו

Greatly missed by their children, 
grandchildren and great grandchildren

Rav Aryeh and Dvora Weinberger
Bernie and Leah Weinberger

Menachem and Hannah Katten

In observance of the Shloshim of our friend
Yehuda Leib Berren z"l

Rav Menachem Weinberg will give a shiur 
in his memory "Heroic Joy"

Monday evening, 23 November/ 8 Kislev 
7:30pm

Zoom Meeting: 853 8980 1519
Password: Yehuda

SEALING SERVICES  
AND ROOFING

YOUR REAL ESTATE AGENT  
IN JERUSALEM
Purchase/Sell
Debisraelhomes@gmail.com

Whatsapp 0532852345


